
Monday, January 13, 2025 

Announcements 

Seniors 

Good morning Dons!  Are you currently struggling to get 
your grades up in your classes?  For Dons, By Dons is here 
to help.  We have peer tutors who are ready to help you 
with your academic questions.  Today’s tutoring during 6th 
period is MATH.  Sign up for peer tutoring using the 5 Star 
app.  Look for the tab called “DONS Support” and you will 
find the digital sign up sheet right there.  Remember,  
students helping other students to achieve is the greatest 
way to rise together. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Attention Dons:  After school tutoring with For Dons, By 
Dons will be held TODAY in Room 206 from 3:30pm to 
4:30pm.  Tutoring is available for all core subjects like 
Math, Science, History, English and Foreign Languages.  
Take charge of your education and attend tutoring.  You 
won’t regret taking this step in the right direction. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Attention Students with Parking Permits:  As a reminder, 
you are supposed to be parking where the yellow lines are.  
You are NOT allowed to park in the first four rows of 
parking.  If you do not follow the rules of your parking 
permit, your parking permit will be revoked. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Attention Seniors:  Have you ordered your cap and gown 
yet?  If not, go to the Senior Info section of SVDons.com 
and click on the link to Jostens to get your order in today.  
Make sure you are ready for graduation and don’t wait 
until the last minute! 

Boys Frosh Soccer vs Bishop Amat 
  @ Sierra Vista - 3:30 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Girls Varsity Water Polo vs Pioneer 
  @ Pioneer - 3:30 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Sports 

Attention Dons:  Our thoughts are with everyone impacted 
by the L.A. County Fires as such, N.H.S. is launching an 
emergency aid donation to provide much needed relief to 
families who have suffered great losses.  Please consider 
donating items for men, women and kids like shoes, new or 
gently used outer wear like jackets, sweat shirts and pants, 
new under garments, socks, baby items like clothing, food 
and diapers and new personal hygiene items.  Other items 
needed are household cleaning supplies, laundry detergent, 
kitchen utensils and portable stoves.  You can drop 
donations off at Mrs. Payan’s room, Room 510, or come by 
if you have any questions. 
 
Hey Dons:  Do you want to be in the Drama Club’s Spring 
play “She Kills Monsters”?  Well, here is your chance!  On 
Thursday, January 16th, the Drama Club will be hosting 
auditions in Room SVMS afterschool!  Anyone is welcome! 

Clubs & Activities 



Faculty Section 

 

 

 

Please Release The Following 

Girls Varsity Water Polo 

@ 1:00 

Boys Frosh Soccer 

@ 2:30 

Yearbook 

Group D 

has duty this week 

Seniors:  Do you want to have your autograph in this 
year’s yearbook?  If so, come by Room 513 during Brunch 
or Lunch on Tuesday and Wednesday to sign.  This will 
have to be done in person, we will not accept digital  
signatures.  Name only, no nicknames, no images or any 
other writing other than your autograph.  We hope to see 
you on Tuesday or Wednesday.  Seniors ONLY!  You DO 
NOT have to purchase a sign.  We cannot take signatures 
after Wednesday at Lunch. 
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